Purchase Request No: 2022-03-254
Mode of Procurement: NP-SVP

Republic of the Philippines
enguet State Tniversity

2601 La Trinidad, Benguet
www.bsu.edu.ph

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) NO: 264

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATIONS

Cuine tem [JSublot [JLot

STARLAB MEDICAL AND SCIENTIFIC
EVALUATION OF QUOTATIONS SCI LAB TRADING APPARATUS SUPPLY BELMAN LABORATORIES
Date and Time of Receipt of RFQ 4-May-22 10-May-22 07-May-22
Eligibility Requirements [] Pass [ ] FAL [] Pass [ JraL [] Pass [Jran
Technical and Financial Requirements
IT':,II QTY| UNIT ITEM AND DESCRIPTION ABC BRAND/MODEL UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | BRAND/MODEL | UNIT COST | TOTAL COST | BRAND/MODEL UNIT COST | TOTAL COST REMARKS
LABORATORY SUPPLIES
E.1 CHEMICALS/REAGENTS
Iron Source
1 v bottle |Sodium EDTA, 500grams/bottle 3,500.00 1,700.00 3,400.00 2,700.00 5,400.00 no bid
500g/bottle SCI LAB TRADING
Loba Chemie
330 (Offer: Ferrous
2 2 bottle |Ferrous sulfate, 500grams/bottle 3,000.00 5 ! b t‘ti 2,@_% Loba Chemie 1,950.00 3,900.00 Sulphate|  1,261.00/500g 2,522.00f BELMAN LABORATORIES
00g/bottle Heptahydarde 99%
AR/ACS)
Loba Chemie
{Meso-Inositol 3,967.00/25g
3 | 10 | bottles |Myo-Inositol, 100g/bottle 85,000.00 no bid no bid 99% (Myo-Inasitol)| (25gx40bottle=10 158,680.00
For Biochemistry) 00g
Loba Chemie
(Gibberellic Acid
4 4 bottle |Giberelic acid (GA3)}{@10grams/bottle) 6,000.00 no bid 1,950.00/1g 7,800.00| Extra Pure Plant 3,993.00/10g 15,972.00|
growth stimulator
Growth Regulators
5 1 bottle |Benzyl Amino purine 10grams/bottle 5,500.00 5,500.00 5,500.00 8,320.00/5g 8,320.00| no bid
sg/bottle SCI LAB TRADING
La.ba Chemie 4,791.00/10g, " -
6 | 3 | bottles |Adenine sulfate, 100grams/bottle 32,760.00 no bid Loba Chemie| 7,920.00/10g 23,760.00| (Adenine Sulfate (10g x 30 143,730.00 SCEWF,CT;,FWTUS';T,PW
AR 99%) bottle=300g)
Loba Chemie
(Indole-3-Butyric
7 2 bottles |Indole-butyric acid, 10grams/bottle 7,600.00 4300.00 9,000.00| Loba Chemie 6,600.00 13,200.00 Acid 99% for 3,993.00/5¢ (5¢ 15,972.00
5g/bottle . : x 4 bottle =20g
Biochemistry)
Supelco (Offer;
. Paclobutrazul
8 | 4 | bottles |Paclobutrazol, 10grams/bottle 26,000.00 6,500.00 26,000.00 no bid material, Trace| 17-589.00/ 50mg SCI LAB TRADING
CERT.
Sigma Aldrich
(Thidiazuron
. . . Suitable for Plants
9 2 packs |Thidiazuron, 3grams/pack 3,000.00 no bid no bid cell cufturs; 19,980.00/ 25mg|
Bioreagent)
3 S k




Labscan
(Potassium
: Dih
10 | 1 | bottle |KH2POA (Potassium biphospate), 500grams/bottle 3,500.00 2,300.00 2,300.00 Hi media 2,800.00 280000 nho;h‘;‘:;‘:t: 1,597.00/500g]  1,597.00| BELMAN LABORATORIES
Anhydrous, 99.5%
AR
Other chemicals/Reagents
11 | 10 | bottles |Agar, 1kg/bottle 75,000.00 7,100.00 71,000.00 2,800.00 28,000.00| Titan Media (Agar|  3,811.00/500g 76,220.00
500g/bottle agar Powder| (500g x 20bottle STARLAB MEDICAL AND
=10kgs SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
12 3 | bottles |Tween 20, 1li/bottle 5,400.00 1,800.00 500m! 5,400.00| no bid Loba Chemie ( 2,075.00/ | 12,450.00
tween 20 Extral o1« Gbottle = SCI LAB TRADING
Pure) 31
E.3 OTHER LABORATORY SUPPLIES
13 50 pcs | Test tubes, Round bottom, heat Resistance, Acid 3,000.00 60.00 3,000.00 pyrex 50.00/pcs 2,500.00 no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
Resistance, Regular SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
14 1 kilo |Rubber bond (Ordinary): Assorted Color. 250.00 no bid no bid no bid
15 22 packs |Cotton, 300g/pack 8,140.00 350.00 7,700.00 300/roll 6,600.00 no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
| . 3 1 i .00 ,000. ,080.
16 5 | carbouy |Ethyl Alcohol, 95% 22,500.00 4,200.00 w/cby 21,000.00/ technical 4,200 21,000.00 etvhanoi 95% 3,080.00/cby 15,400.00 BELMAN LABORATORIES
Technical Grade
17 | 10 | gallons |Isoprophyl alcohol, 70%, 4li/gallon 7,500.00 720.00 7,200.00 1,100.00 11,000.00 no bid SCI LAB TRADING
18 5 boxes |Scalpel blade, #24 7,500.00 1,400.00 7,000.00 china 1,350.00 6,750.00 no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
19 2 boxes |Scalpel blade, #11 3,000.00 1,400.00 2,800.00 china 1,350.00 z,m,ml no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
20 | 120 | gallons |Purified Water refill 3,600.00 no bid no bid no bid
21 20 rolls | Paper towels, jumbo, 2ply, plain 1,900.00 no bid 120.00/pack 2,400.00 no bid
22 10 boxes |Surgical mask,(K95) 5,000.00 no bid no bid no bid
23 | 10 | boxes [Surgical gloves 5,000.00| 480.00 4,800.00 480.00 4,800.00 no bid SCI LAB TRADING
24 8 pcs  |Slipper(sleep on) :,soo.on} no bid no bid no bid
25 7 pcs  |Heavy duty vynil water proof apron 1,750.00 no bid no bid no bid
26 3 sets |Bottle cleaning brushes (8 inches 1set) 1,050.00 no bid no bid no bid
kartell (wash
h I
| 5] pa [RERDRERNI S G 2,500.00 500,00 2,500.00 Germany 290.00 1,450,00 Bottle  24400/pcs|  1,220.00] BELMAN LABORATORIES
apparatus) polyEthylene(PE),
250ml
28 6 pcs | Alcohol lamp burner glass (cap metal)(120ml 1,800.00 280.00 1,680.00 china 270.00 1,620.00 no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
capacity) SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
29 8 pcs  |Atomizer sprayer, air gun 1,200.00 150.00 1,200.00 china 1,190.00 9,520.00 no bid SCI LAB TRADING
30 5 pcs | Pipette Dropper glass 300.00 no bid 58.00 290.00 no bid STARLAB MEDICAL AND
SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
0000000O00O0ON0000NN
ol WS
End User TWG Member TWG Member

BAC RESOLUTION TO AWARD

RECOMMENDATION / RESOLUTION

No:

to21- 1%)

Date: MAY 3 1 2077

HEREAS, upon review of the legal, financial and technical requirements or documents and quotations of supplier/s on the item/s which is/are reflected in the request for quotations; be it RESOLVED as it hereby done to
recommend to the Head of Procuring Entity (HOPE) the award of the project as follows:

Name of Supplier Item/sub-lot/lot No. LCRQ/SCRQ Total Amount Remarks/ Justification
1. |Sci Lab Trading 158121723 and 29 LCRQ 53,500.00
Stariab Medical and Scientific Apparatus
2. |supply 6,11,13,15,18,19,28 and 30 LCRQ 72,220.00 g / P
3. |Belman Laboratores 2,10,16 and 27 CRQ 4 20,739.00 )~ 7
@' pace 1 6F Y




[IDeclaration of Failure under Section 35 of the Revised IRR of RA 9184
All prospective bidders are declared ineligible [Sec. 35.1 (b)] m ] bids failed to comply with all the bid requirements or fail post qualification [Sec. 35.1(c)]

DAMQUIAL ODELON C. DULAY/ HAZELINE N. TIBANGAY SHEILA MARY V. BASQUIAL/VERONICA REINA E. AF
End-user : I/Architech |li Administrative Officer llIl/Administrative Officer,

ember/Alternate Member
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evised: May 2022
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